
Register	early	for	the	19th	European	AIDS
Conference.	
The	 19th	 European	 AIDS	 Conference	 (#EACS2023),	 will	 be	 organised	 in
Warsaw,	Poland	20	years	after	the	first	EACS	Conference	in	Eastern	Europe,
18-21	October	2023.	

Under	 the	 theme	 "It's	 time	 to	 revisit!"	 various	 topics	will	 be	 presented	 and
discussed	 through	 plenary	 and	 parallel	 sessions,	 meet-the-experts,	 clinical
cases,	 round	 tables,	 best	 ePoster	 discussions	 and	 industry-sponsored
sessions.

The	early	bird	rate	is	still	available	until	27	July.	

Don't	miss	it	and	join	us	in	Warsaw.

Important	dates	for	the	19th	European	AIDS
Conference	
To	 make	 sure	 you	 don't	 miss	 anything	 for	 the	 19th	 European	 AIDS
Conference,	here	are	some	important	dates	to	remember:	
	

30	June:	Abstract	submission	deadline
13	July:	Deadline	to	submit	scholarship	applications
27	July:	Early	registration	fee	available
16	August:	Clinical	cases	submission	deadline

	
Visit	the	website	for	more	information.

Call	of	interest	for	participation	in	the
development	of	the	European	Diploma	in
HIV	Medicine
EACS	is	developing	a	European	Diploma	in	HIV	Medicine.	The	diploma	will
be	 designed	 as	 an	 examination	 that	 will	 ensure	 minimum	 standards	 of
education	 and	 training	 in	 HIV	 Medicine	 whilst	 promoting	 the	 delivery	 of	 a
uniform	 standard	 of	 clinical	 care	 in	 the	 field	 of	 HIV	 Medicine.	 The
development	of	this	examination	will	be	in	partnership	with	the	Royal	College
of	 Physicians	 in	 Ireland	 (RCPI)	 which	 will	 provide	 end-to-end	 candidate
management	and	examination	administration.
	
The	European	Diploma	 in	HIV	Medicine	Examination	Board	 is	 launching	an
open	call	to	join	them.
	
A	 faculty	 of	 specialists	 in	 HIV	 have	 developed	 the	 core	 curriculum	 and	 an
Examination	 Board	 has	 been	 convened.	 In	 addition,	 there	 will	 be
opportunities	 to	 contribute	 to	 the	 examination	 and	 to	 join	 one	 of	 the
committees.	The	activities	will	include	content	development,	peer	review,	and
defining	standards	for	academic	performance.
	
There	 are	 three	 key	 areas	 where	 the	 Examination	 Board	 wishes	 to	 recruit
contributors.	These	are:
	

Examination	board	members
Question	development	panelists
Standard	setters
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Click	here	for	more	information	and	register	your	interest!	

Join	the	WAVE	in	Ukraine	online	workshop
as	a	speaker	discussant
WAVE	is	looking	for	speakers	and	discussants	for	the	‘WAVE	in	Ukraine’	online
workshop	 taking	 place	 online	 on	 21-22	 September	 2023	 from	 16:00-
17:00	CEST.

The	session	will	focus	on:	
HPV
Mental	wellbeing

	
“WAVE	 in	 Ukraine”	 is	 a	 series	 of	 webinars	 organised	 since	 2020	 for	 the
Ukrainian	healthcare	providers.	Each	session	 is	 composed	of	 two	90-minute
webinars	 taking	 place	 on	 two	 days.	 Each	 webinar	 features	 mini	 lecture(s),
panel	discussions	and	case	driven	discussions	covering	different	 topics.	The
faculty	comes	both	from	Western	Europe	and	Ukraine.

If	you	are	interested	and	would	like	to	give	a	lecture,	participate	as
discussant	or	present	a	case,	please	contact	the	WAVE	secretariat	by	23	June.
(wavesecretariat@eacsociety.org)			

Apply	for	the	Hector	Research	Award!
The	 H.W.	 &	 J.	 Hector	 Foundation,	 Weinheim,	 is	 announcing	 a	 prize	 for
European	 HIV	 research,	 which	 will	 be	 awarded	 for	 the	 best	 scientific
achievements	in	the	HIV	research	area	in	2022/2023.
	
Dotation:
EUR	20,000	for	the	best	clinical	and/or	epidemiological	paper;
EUR	20,000	for	the	best	basic	science,	translational	paper.
	
Any	paper	on	an	HIV-related	topic	that	has	been	accepted	or	published	 in	a
peer-reviewed	journal	within	the	last	24	months	(i.e.	from	18	October	2021)
before	the	start	of	the	19th	European	AIDS	Conference	(#EACS	2023)	can	be
submitted.
	
Deadline:	15	August	2023		
	
Learn	more!

Life4me+	launches	the	"Stay	on	ART"
project
Life4me+	has	launched	an	international	project	to	enable	access	to	ART	when
abroad.
	
Moving	 to	 another	 country	 or	 temporary	 labor	 migration	 is	 not	 necessarily
easy	 and	 presents	many	 challenges.	One	 of	 them	 is	 to	make	 sure	 you	 are
able	 to	 continue	 taking	 care	 of	 your	 health.	 The	 "Stay	 on	 ART"	 project
provides	 answers	 to	 the	 most	 frequently	 asked	 questions,	 based	 on
experience	and	thousands	of	requests.
	

Is	it	possible	to	carry	antiretroviral	therapy	with	you?
How	and	where	to	get	ART?
Is	it	possible	to	buy	treatment	in	pharmacies?
Where	to	go	for	support	in	emergency	situations?

	
On	 the	 project	 website	 www.stayonart.com	 it	 provides	 step-by-step
algorithms	 for	 obtaining	 medical	 care	 and	 ART,	 brief	 instructions	 for
completing	 the	 necessary	 documents,	 useful	 links	 and	 contacts	 for	 public
organizations	ready	to	provide	assistance.
	
Learn	more!

https://www.eacsociety.org/education/diploma-in-hiv-medicine/
mailto:wavesecretariat@eacsociety.org
https://www.eacsociety.org/european-aids-conference/european-hector-research-award-in-hiv/
http://www.stayonart.com/
https://www.eacsociety.org/about-eacs/news/


You	can	access	below	all	the	materials	and
information	related	to	the	European	AIDS
Conference	and	the	EACS	core	activities.

More	info

EACS	Resource	Library

Have	a	look	at	the	new	interactive	website	of	the
latest	version	of	the	European	Guidelines	for	the
treatment	of	people	living	with	HIV	in	Europe.

More	info

EACS	Guidelines	version	11.1	

Follow	the	practical	and	comprehensive	course
on	management	of	HIV,	including:	the	latest
findings	and	guidelines	on	how	to	manage,	treat
and	prevent	HIV	and	related	diseases;
optimisation	of	HIV	treatment	programmes	and
other	related	topics.

More	info

Free	Management	of	HIV	and	Co-
infections	Online	Course

Don't	forget	to	check	EACS	social	media	accounts
to	stay	updated	on	the	most	important	news
related	to	HIV		care.	We	are	on	Twitter,
Facebook,	LinkedIn,	Instagram	and	Youtube.

EACS	Social	Media	Accounts

CALENDAR
EACS	activities:

4-8	September:	HIV	Summer	School.	More	info
21-22	September:	WAVE	in	Ukraine	online	workshop.	More	info
18-21	October:	19th	European	AIDS	Conference.	More	info

	
Other	events:

23–26	July:	IAS	Conference	on	HIV	Science.	More	info
	

Become	an	EACS	Member
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